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Abstract 
Generally, rural women are majorly involved in agricultural activities such as planting, weeding, harvesting, 
processing and marketing. They also keep some domestic animals and birds. Empowering rural women will go a 
long way to improving the economic life of the women and also the well-being of individuals, families and the 
rural communities. Social, cultural traditions and agricultural constraints can limit rural women’s economic 
status. Rural women’s limited access to productive resources, low educational level and illiteracy are 
contributors to rural women’s poverty. Illiteracy affects their chances to benefit from newer, non-traditional 
methods such as: information and communication technologies. The promotion of agricultural development 
should be through the provision of useful and relevant information to the farming communities by the extension 
services. The unpaid work that women perform at home and farm are not recognized for official record. There 
are many constraints making rural women farmers to be lagging behind economically, apart from lack of 
agricultural information. The main constraints are the lack of personal land and credit. There is evidence that 
empowering women in multiple ways will contribute to their own food security and nutrition and that of their 
families. Women are limited in terms of their potential in contributing to agricultural development. Reducing the 
gender disparities or discrimination will generate significant gains for the agricultural sector. There is the need 
for national laws and policies that promote women’s rights to own land, property and have equal access to credit 
for their businesses.  
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1. Introduction 
The major occupation of the rural people in Nigeria is farming. Women in rural communities play significant 
roles in achieving the transformation necessary for economic and social changes for sustainable national 
development. The Food and Agricultural Organization (FAO, 1995) cited by Lo (2000) reported that rural 
women constitute 70% of the agricultural workers, 60-70% of the labour, 80% of food storage and transportation 
from farm to village and 60% of the harvesting and marketing. Despite all these activities majority of rural 
women are still poor. It is noteworthy the remarkable part that women play in many developing countries in 
agricultural development (Egbugara, 1993). Generally, women are majorly involved in food cultivation, 
production, processing, preparation and marketing despite these activities women contribution to food and 
agricultural production are still largely underestimated. Many programmes fail to recognize the diversity of 
women’s life experiences. However, a holistic approach is rarely used to understand and address the many forms 
of discrimination and inequality that affect them in relation to food security (Goetz, 2007).  

Various strategies have been used to develop women through different programmes by the Federal Government. 
However, these programmes are short-lived, sometimes due to change of government. Also, the programmes 
may not have been carried out in a manner that meets the needs of the rural women. Some of these programmes 
were: Better life for rural women, poverty alleviation and presently women empowerment. This may also be 
abandoned by the new government. The lack of continuity of government programmes and policies has been a 
major problem causing setbacks in rural development, which in essence also has negative effects.  
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Economic status has always been used as a measure to categorize male farmers, but more often female farmers 
have been regarded as a homogenous group who are only distinguished by gender. Their productive economic 
roles are regarded as part of their domestic roles (Egbugara, 1990). It is assumed that when the economic 
prosperity of their husbands improves, then the economic status of the wives will also improve, this is not always 
applicable to all women, especially rural women. 

In rural communities, the occupational structure is characterized by those enterprises considered acceptable to 
the women folks through socio-cultural norms and practices. The enterprises have impacts on the stability of the 
household, the progress of the village and rural communities. The income of farmers in Nigeria is determined by 
the market price offered to agricultural products. In most part of the northern states in Nigeria, religion and 
tradition prohibit women from participating in open marketing. The majority of people selling items in the 
market in that part of the country are men. The few women selling are from other parts of the country. 

2. Discussion 
2.1 Food and Nutrition Security through Agriculture 

Malnutrition is a major issue and of great concern in the poorest countries of the world and is closely associated 
with overall low food intake both in quantity and quality. Sub-Saharan Africa has the highest percentage of those 
undernourished (approximately one in four people) though that number varies by country (FAO, 2014).  

Agriculture can play a central role in addressing the issue of poverty and food security. It is, therefore, necessary 
for government leaders, policymakers and development practitioners to support and make the improvement of 
agricultural productivity a priority in their agenda, because it is paramount to achieving the desired food and 
nutrition security targets. In most developing countries, agriculture is one of the major pillars of the economy. 
Encouraging agricultural based innovative ventures will help the advancement of women in rural areas. It is, 
therefore, needful to empower rural women through agricultural policies that assist them take care of their needs 
and alleviate poverty.  

In most of the developing countries, women participate in the production of vegetables under the home-based 
and backyard gardening. Also, they are involved in the keeping and rearing of rabbits, goats, poultry birds 
(chicken, duck, guinea fowl), pigs and fish are being raised and managed at home by women. These agricultural 
activities are carried out by women in order to raise the nutritional status of their households (Fabiyi, 2015). 

2.2 Women’s Contribution to Agricultural Development 

Globally, women contribute remarkably to the rural economy and agricultural activities in many developing 
countries (FAO, 2010a). According to the reports of FAO (2010b) the agricultural share of economically active 
women was 65.0% in Sub-Saharan Africa in 2010. While in Nigeria the agricultural share of economically active 
women was reported to be 26.8% in 2010.  

The economic role of women in farming cannot be compared with that of men. The labour of women starts from 
the time of cultivation to the time of marketing of the farm products. Selling of the farm produces for income is 
done mainly by women, especially in the southern part of Nigeria. This shows the importance of women in 
farming business. One of the most significant roles is earning income from the farm produce.  

Women are largely responsible for production that benefits local consumption, such as maize, groundnuts, 
legumes and vegetables on smaller farms. The lands are culturally obtained from husbands, fathers or/and other 
close relatives. Women have no personal land for farming. Women sometimes have to pay men labourers to do 
some tasks that they may not be able to perform; such as land preparation and heap making for root crops. 
Women are not paid for working on family farms, self-employed producers, on and off employees, traders and 
providers of services (Hill, 2011). Women also play a key role in food and agricultural processing at home and 
community levels. This processing work is vital for making raw grains, roots, tubers, pulses, vegetables, milk, 
fish and other products into nutritious and acceptable form, safe food, yet it is often not recognized, documented 
or appreciated. 

In many rural communities in Nigeria, women are involved in processing of farm produce as well as marketing 
the agricultural products as self-employment and thereby enhancing the financial status of their family. These 
women prepare and sell cooked foods, local beverage drinks and snacks for example bean cake, groundnut cake, 
buns and yoghurt. In some part of northern Nigeria, the rural nomadic Fulani women milk the cows and process 
the milk collected into yoghurt, cheese and butter on a relatively large scale basis for marketing. It has been 
observed that it is virtually the processed milk and its processed products that sustain the Fulani family in 
Nigeria (Amedzo, 1988). 
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The United Nations Food and Agriculture Organization (FAO) reports that women comprise about 43% of the 
agricultural labour force in developing countries. The percentage is as high as or even higher than 80% in some 
countries in Sub-Saharan African countries (FAO, 2011). The majority of food production that is attributable to 
women makes them the true agents of food security and household welfare in rural areas. 

In Nigeria, women work more than men in the cocoa plantations, in coffee production for export and in 
marketing crops such as rice, maize and cassava (Fresco, 1998). In spite of this heavy involvement, evidence 
from studies has shown that rural women are usually disadvantaged in their access to all factors of agricultural 
production, marketing and processing. In Nigeria, male farmers enjoy extension services and agricultural 
information more than female farmers. 

Apart from relegation, there are many constraints that make women poor despite their enormous potentials in 
farming. Some of the constraints are: lack of farming implements and equipment, lack of access to land, lack of 
credit or limited capital for farm operations. Empowerment of rural women should be done directly from the 
federal government to the rural women. It should not go through state or local governments in order to prevent 
diversion or delay. Therefore, the main objective of this study is to suggest ways to improve rural women’s 
economic status through agricultural activities; specific objectives are to: 

 Identify major constraints hindering rural women’s economic status. 
 Identify areas of their contributions to agricultural development in the country and 
 Explain reasons why they remain poor despite all their labours.  

2.3 Reasons and Causes of Poverty among Rural Women in Nigeria 

Women comprise the majority of the poor. They constitute the majority of unpaid productive workers through 
their labour on family farms and other domestic activities (UNDESA, 2010). Yet they are usually expected to 
manage their families’ nutritional needs in the face of these constraints and poverty (Holmes, Jones & Marsden, 
2009; World Bank/FAO/IFAD, 2009). Their productive capacity is also being undermined due to their lack of 
access to productive resources such as land, seeds, and credit (IDS, 2014). 

In spite of their effort and immense contributions to agriculture, rural women are still among the relegated 
groups in the society and the poor. In Nigeria, women are relegated in various ways. In some homes, women 
have no say in matters pertaining family finance or even access to family finance. Likewise in urban areas 
Nigerian women also experience gender discrimination and relegation, for instance, in offices men occupied the 
key positions and in the nation, whereas, women have to cry out or lobby before few of them are given 
reasonable positions.  

According to Federal Office of Statistics (FOS, 1999), about 73% of the female farm holders in Nigeria are poor. 
In addition to the lack of agricultural farm equipment and land constraints, lack of support from their husbands 
can lead to the lack of success in their farm activities. A woman can do very little without the husband's 
emotional, physical and financial support. In addition, psychologically and socially some husbands may create 
barriers for their wives economic success when they notice that they are economically successful more than them. 
This is one of the major problems hindering many women’s progress in life. It should be noted that the economic 
improvement of women will also lead to the improvement of almost all aspects of the family wellbeing, 
particularly the nutritional status of the family. If a woman is poor it will reflect in the diet of the family, but if 
she is economically buoyant she will ensure the food security of her household. The notion of males as 
breadwinners and the females as housewives has made men occupy the best position with high economic benefit 
than women. Less attention is given to rural women farmers needs when compared to men farmers, with regards 
to the provision of agricultural extension services. These women are assumed to play the supportive role as 
farmers’ wives and they are, therefore, most often neglected and not involved in the agricultural programmes 
(Samanta, 1994).  

2.4 Rural Women’s Constraints in Agricultural Production and Marketing 

Rural women in developing countries (including Nigeria) have been found to play a major role in agricultural 
activities in the areas of food production and marketing. In the Northern part of Nigeria, most rural women do 
not farm or sell agricultural produce but do more processing. Men are more involved in agricultural activities 
than women because women are in partial or total seclusions in the Islamic States. Other constraints limiting 
rural women’s agricultural productivity are land tenure system, lack of access to loans, illiteracy, multiple family 
responsibilities and other cultural, religious barriers and also the way that agricultural services are staffed, 
managed and designed (Jiggins, 1989; Olawoye, 1989; FAO, 1993). Many rural women may not have access to 
improved technologies and innovations, agro-chemicals and fertilizers which are essential for agricultural 
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business. It is important that women’s enormous contribution to agriculture be recorded, recognized and 
encouraged. There must be a deliberate effort to empower women to release their potentials, energies and 
production abilities. The Women in Agriculture (WIA) under the control of Agricultural Development Projects 
(ADP) need to focus more on policies and organise programmes targeted towards effectively addressing the 
problems or constraints of women farmers in the agricultural production in rural areas. The new extension 
perspective must address emerging local and global issues in order to be relevant to meet the needs of the people. 
The imbalance in agricultural extension services needs to be improved. In Nigeria, there are more male extension 
agents than females and they pay attention more to male farmers (Spence, 2001). 

2.5 Importance of Women’s Education in Agriculture and Rural Development 

Agriculture in most developing countries of the world is a major key in enhancing food security and reducing the 
level poverty. Women account for more than half of the world’s agricultural production, in spite of this fact, the 
men folks have access to more training than women. Agricultural and enterprise training for women is crucial for 
improving their farm yields and raise their living standard (CSD, 2009). 

Rural women tend to be disadvantaged compared with men because they have less education, capital and they 
cannot easily obtain credit. The Nigeria’s philosophy of education is based on the integration of the individual 
into a sound and effective citizen and equal educational opportunities for all citizens of the nation from primary 
to tertiary levels (Fabiyi, 2015). There is the need for a type of education which must equip the receiver with 
necessary skills to face the challenging situations which can be economic, social, political and cultural in nature. 

Education and training are essential tools necessary for alleviating poverty and hunger. Women that are educated 
have a more likelihood to be healthier, have better earnings and exercise greater decision-making power within 
the household than the illiterate women (IDS, 2014). Educated women are also more likely to make sure that 
their children go to school. From a development perspective, investing in girls’ education has the highest rate of 
returns of any possible investment in developing countries (IDS, 2014). Education and training are crucial to the 
improvement of agricultural and non-farm productivity and reducing household poverty levels. 

Nigerian women like all women all over the world, especially in most developing countries, continue to face 
several forms of discrimination which stands as hindrances to developing to their full potential (Okebukola, 
2001). In the northern part of Nigeria, opportunities for participation in education are less for girls than for boys. 
When the girls grow up and become women, lack of education becomes compounded leading to social and 
economic backwardness. One of the main barriers holding back the advancement of women in Nigeria is the 
high level of female illiteracy (Federal Office of Statistics, 2000 cited by Okebukola, 2001). According to 
Adekanye (1985), education of women provides an instrument for integration into development and for 
enhancing their contribution in the rural economy. Sound education can bring about change in behaviours, 
adoption of new technology in farming, creativity in handcraft and in food security.  

3. Conclusion and Recommendations 
In Sub-Saharan Africa, 43.8% of women accounted for economically active population, in 2010, and in Nigeria, 
the women share of the economically active population was 36.9% in the same year according to the reports of 
FAO (2010b). 

There is the need for empowering women in their roles as caregivers and household keepers which is a crucial 
factor for enhancing food security and nutritional living standard for themselves and for their children. In recent 
times, gender issues are now gradually being looked into as it affects agricultural and economic development of 
the rural economy. African women’s involvement in farming and handcraft shows that they are physically and 
intellectually capable of economic independence (Yahaya, 2002). It is necessary for women to live independent 
financial life and reduce the dependence on their husbands. 

 More research should be conducted on rural women’s poverty and female farmers’ relationship with their 
husbands in farm productions.  

 There is the need to ensure involvement of full participation of women who are poor and are less educated 
in agricultural business.  

 There should be provision for agricultural innovations and technologies to be practically used in the field.  

 Women farmers’ seminars should be organized to share with researchers and field staff their technical 
problems specific to women farmer’s production systems. 

 Women should be taught and encouraged to engage in large-scale farming and not only sustenance farming, 
especially as it pertains to food crops, vegetables, fruits and fishery businesses. Financial empowerment should 
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be given to rural women farmers. These should be done directly from the federal government to the rural women. 
It should not go through the state and local governments. Governments should meticulously and systematically 
carry out the empowerment programmes for rural women. This will greatly reduce the poverty level among rural 
women farmers and others. 

 Attention should be paid to the untapped productive potential of rural women in Nigeria. 

 Awareness should be raised about women as agents of food production and that constraints to women 
productivity should be reduced through land rights legislation, compensation for unpaid work and access to 
credit for farming. 

 There should be the establishment of business training and schemes in villages and remote rural areas to 
assist women in the management of their savings to support their own business enterprises. 

 Creation of drop-in-sessions where women can ask questions and get advice on how to go about their 
agricultural practices and their business enterprises. 

 The federal government should encourage and initiate the development of rural women’s self-help and 
savings groups  

 The government should build rural storage facilities for proper storage of their farm produce in order to 
prevent spoilage and wastage of resources.  

 Gender sensitivity is essential when carrying out programmes, training and workshops in rural settings.  

Poverty alleviation of the Nigerian rural women can be achieved majorly by supporting and bringing about 
improvement in their agricultural activities and implementing policies the will empower them and enhance 
productivity. Additionally, the government can provide education and vocational training, enterprise 
development training, financial empowerment (micro-credit), improved extension services and special 
agricultural technologies for rural women farmers. All these will consequently result in a better standard of living 
and improved economic status of the Nigerian rural women as well as their household.  
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